
Climbing aids  
for more  
safety!
Better ground traction  
for tracked vehicles in  
steep and rough terrain.

Your contact person  
for climbing aids

www.esto-innovation.eu



Climbing aids  
for better 
ground traction.

The use of machines in steep slopes and rough ter-
rain poses extreme difficult working conditions and 
great challenges and risks for people. 

With the climbing aids from Esto, we want to contri-
bute to more safety for people and machines.

Quick and  
easy  
installation.

On difficult terrain, Esto‘s climbing aids increase 
ground traction. Especially in icy and snowy condi-
tions, the climbing aids can protect excavators and 
tracked vehicles from sliding sideways on steep slo-
pes. Convince yourself of our expertise!

	 SAFETY
	 in difficult terrain! 

The special construction of the climbing aids increa-
ses safety against lateral slipping. 

Especially in snow, ice, mud, heavy rain and steep 
slopes, the easy-to-install climbing aids provide bet-
ter ground traction and thus more stability for chain-
driven tracked vehicles.

	 EASY INSTALLATION 
	 without any problems! 

Easy and quick installation of two identical compo-
nents that are screwed together using high-strength 
bolts. 

There are through-holes in the climbing aids to pre-
vent damage to the threads. 

Installation and dismantling are trouble-free. If ne-
cessary, damaged bolts can be removed by cutting 
them off with an angle grinder.

	 PRODUCTION 
	 modern & professional! 

Our professional design services are the basis for 
economical and innovative solutions. We work with 
the latest software technology for the planning and 
implementation of our projects. 

As an experienced specialist in CNC manufacturing, 
we use the most modern machines for all common 
processing methods, such as turning and milling. 
This allows us to meet our high standards of quality 
and performance.

Learn more  
in our video!


